
364 BOOK REVIEWS 

tion of equilibrium is justified for the situations 
considered in this book, it is not justified when 
studying mineral assemblages. Given, then, that an 
equilibrium thermodynamic approach is of con- 
siderable use in petrology, students should have a 
reasonable appreciation of this approach before 
going on to diffusion and kinetics, at least at the 
level presented in this book. My experience is that 
it is difficult to teach the former, let alone the latter, 
in a crowded undergraduate syllabus (however 
unfortunate that may be). 

It is unfortunate that the production of the 
diagrams is not better--though I gather that a 
'misunderstanding' between the author and their 
publisher, Blackwells, was the cause--certainly 
Blackwells can have no reason to be proud of this 
and the authors every reason to be annoyed. 
Incidentally, I like to see G-X loops have infinite 
slopes at the axes for thermodynamic correctness. 

A valuable addition to the geological literature. 

ROGER POWELL 

weakness. In such a compilation of information and 
ideas it is the author's responsibility to summarize 
and synthesize. 

In spite of these critical comments the book 
contains a wealth of useful information which has 
never before been incorporated in a single volume. 
Notable sections include: the author's comprehen- 
sive classification of tin deposits (chapter 3), which 
integrates environmental, morphological, and 
mineral-chemical parameters; a discussion (chapter 
6) of the most significant geological features of tin 
deposits and their application to search techniques; 
a very useful appendix which provides notes and 
key references for twenty-three of the most im- 
portant tin provinces; and a comprehensive biblio- 
graphy. Chapter 10 (co-authored with C. Cuff) 
provides an excellent review of the mineralogy and 
crystal chemistry of tin which any mineralogist 
would find useful. 

The high price will discourage most individuals 
from buying this book but everyone engaged in 
tin geology will need to refer to it. 

N. J. JACKSON 

Taylor, R. G. Geology of Tin Deposits. (Develop- 
ments in Economic Geology, 11.) Amsterdam, 
Oxford, and New York (Elsevier), 1979, xii + 544 
pp. Price Dfl. 150 ($73.25). 

Combining both academic and practical informa- 
tion, this book provides a comprehensive overview 
of the major aspects of the geology and search for 
tin. The basis for the text was a course given to 
the Australian Mineral Foundation in 1976 and 
although the work is aimed primarily at research- 
exploration and mining geologists directly involved 
in prospecting and exploiting tin, the well-illustrated 
text will appeal to a much wider readership. The 
major topics discussed include: metallogenic prov- 
inces, classification of primary and secondary 
deposits, characteristics of stanniferous granitoids, 
geological features of tin deposits, exploration 
philosophy, geochemical prospecting, province- 
district and ore-body analysis, low-grade deposits, 
hydrothermal alteration patterns, behaviour of tin 
in the magmatic, hydrothermal, and weathering 
environments, drilling-sampling and ore reserve 
estimation, and tin-bearing minerals. 

Over-emphasis of 'academic' aspects at the ex- 
pense of 'practical' information detracts from the 
over-all usefulness of the book to the exploration/ 
mining geologist. The exploration geologist par- 
ticularly would have appreciated many more case 
studies illustrating different approaches to search- 
ing for tin in a variety of geological environments. 
Furthermore, the lack of synthesis sections con- 
cluding some topics and chapters is a fundamental 

Phillips, W. R. and Griffen, D. T. Optical Minera- 
logy: The Non-opaque Minerals. Oxford and San 
Francisco (W. H. Freeman & Co., Ltd.), 1981. 
xiv+677 pp., 332 figs. Price s 

This book has two parts and was designed to com- 
plement the companion volume Mineral Optics: 
Principles and Techniques [MA 72-824]. Part I 
contains detailed descriptions of the common rock- 
forming minerals and Part II is a set of detailed 
tables of most of the non-opaque minerals arranged 
in order of increasing refringence under five head- 
ings--isotropic, uniaxial (positive and negative), 
and biaxial (positive and negative). 

The first part describes the properties of the 
common rock-forming minerals with emphasis on 
the optical properties although physical properties, 
chemical composition (without chemical analysis), 
structure (with many drawings), alteration pro- 
ducts, and occurrence are also included, and a 
small number of highly selective references (typically 
from 2 to 10) are cited which enable the reader to 
enter the specialist literature dealing with each 
mineral. The arrangement is by chemistry for the 
non-silicates and by structural group for the sili- 
cates. The most important section, especially for 
student use, is the Distinguishing Features listed 
for each mineral. Although this is generally well 
developed, with particular reference to the minerals 


